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Alcidion secures contract with Peninsula Health for Miya Precision 

Highlights 

• Alcidion has signed an agreement with Peninsula Health for use of its Miya Precision platform. 

• This technology supports real-time patient flow management; command centre operations; 
results management; and mobile access to consolidated patient records.  

• The Total Contract Value (TCV) is $3.7M and is structured over a total term of five years.  
 

Melbourne, Victoria | Alcidion Group Limited (ASX:ALC) (Alcidion or Company) has today announced it 
has signed a contract (the ‘Contract’) with Peninsula Health (PH) for use of its Miya Precision platform. 
 
Peninsula Health is a major public health service, providing a broad spectrum of care services across the 
Frankston and the Mornington Peninsula communities in Victoria, Australia. Peninsula Health joins an 
increasing cohort of Victorian Health Systems implementing Alcidion’s Miya Precision platform. 
 
This Contract represents a meaningful investment in optimising care planning and supporting clinicians 
with leading technology at Peninsula Health. Miya Precision provides the capability to improve patient 
access to care and to minimise the administrative burden on frontline hospital staff.  
 
The Total Contract Value (TCV) is $3.7M and is structured over a total term of five years.  
 
Alcidion CEO and MD, Kate Quirke, said: “This deal represents a meaningful step forward for patients 
and families seeking healthcare in southern Victoria. As part of the Contract, Alcidion will implement an 
electronic patient flow management solution, which includes a real time user interface showcasing 
demand, capacity, predicted availability, and tracking for all admitted and emergency patients within all 
Peninsula Health sites, integrated with the existing electronic medical record. We are leading a new 
frontier of innovative and measured healthcare with the Peninsula Health team, which addresses some 
of the most pressing healthcare challenges of our time – availability and accessibility.”   

 

#### ENDS #### 

 

Authorised for ASX release by the Board of Directors of Alcidion Group Limited.  

 

For further information, please contact: 

Investor Relations 

investor@alcidion.com  
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About Alcidion 

Alcidion Group Limited has a simple purpose, that is, to transform healthcare with proactive, smart, 
intuitive technology solutions that improve the efficiency and quality of patient care in healthcare 
organisations, worldwide. 

Alcidion offers a complementary set of software products and technical services that create a unique 
offering in the global healthcare market. Based on the flagship product, Miya Precision, the solutions 
aggregate meaningful information to centralised dashboards, support interoperability, facilitate 
communication and task management in clinical and operational settings and deliver Clinical Decision 
Support at the point of care; all in support of Alcidion’s mission to improve patient outcomes. 

Since listing on the ASX in 2011, Alcidion has acquired multiple healthcare IT companies and expanded 
its foothold in the UK, Australia, and New Zealand to now service over 400 hospitals and 87 healthcare 
organisations, with further geographical expansion planned. 

With over 20 years of healthcare experience, Alcidion brings together the very best in technology and 
market knowledge to deliver solutions that make healthcare better for everyone. 
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